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Minutes of fune 4,2019
Mayor and Board of Aldermen

MITNICIPAL DOCKEI
RDGULI|R MEETING OF JUrE 4, 2Ot9

THE MAYOR AJTD BOARD OF ALDERUEIT
THE CITY OF LOIYG BEACH, TilSSISSIPPI

5:OO O'CLOCK P.lU. LONG BEACH CITY HALL, 2Ol JEFF DAVIS A\IE.********************
CALL TO ORDER
NYVOCATION AI|D PLEDGE OF ALLFGIANCE
ROLL CALL AITD ESTABLISH QUORUM
AIINOUIYCEMEIITS; PRESEIYTATIOI{S; PROCLIIMATIOI{S
l. 2O2O Census Proclamation
AMPtrDIIENTS TO THE MUNICIPAL DOCKET
APPROVE MINUTES:
1. MAYOR AIID BOARI' OF ALDERMEIT

a. Nlay 2l,2OLg * Regular
b. May 21, 2Ol9 - E)recutive Session

2. PLATINITG & DEVELOPIUEXT CO}IMISSIOT
a. illay 23,2Ol9 - Regular

APPROVE [rOCKEt OF CLlrrDrS IyIIMBER{S|:
1. (}6()419
2. The All-Nighters $8OO (Jeepin The Coast Entertainmeat|
3. Category 6 $4,(XX, (Jeepin The Coast Entertainmentf
UIIFInISHED BUSINESS
1. Senior Ceater I'ee Waiver Request - Carnival Assoc. of Long Beach
2. Franchise Agreements - C Spire & Southera Light
IYEW BUSINESS
1. Arnendmeat #3 - Utility Partners Contract
2. Ifork Session - Food Trucks; Reschedule
3. Sidesatk Escrow Discussion - Ndermen l.razer
DEPARTUEITTAL BUSTIYESS
1. MAYOR'S OFFICE
2. PERSONIYEL

a. Police Dept - Step Increase (4|
b. Ftre Dept - Promotion {lf; Termtnatton (lf
c. Recreation - f,es Hire (f)

3. CITYCLERX
a. FiscalYear2O2O Budget Schedule

4. FIRE DEPARTMENT
5. FOLICE DEPARTMEITT
6. EIVGINEERIITG

a. Lolg Beach Pavtag - Term Bid
b. Clower Ave. Yater Maia Inprovements
c. Contract Anendment - Overstreet & Assoc.; MDA/Gulf Coast

Reetoratlon Council, City Engineering Serricee
7. PUBLIC WORI(S
8. RECREATIOIT
9. DERELICT PROPERTIES

t. 24? Roinike Road - Vtrgiuia Norton
REFORT FROM CITY ATTORNEY
1. Vacate Plat - Park Place Coudominiun
ADJOURII {ORl RECESS
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180
Minutes of June 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

Be it remembered that a regular meeting of the Mayor and Board of Aldermeru

Long Beactu Mississippi, was begun and held at 5:00 o'clock p.m, Long Beach City Hall

Meeting Room, 20LJeff Davis Avenue, in said City, it being the first Tuesday in June,

2019, and the same being the time, date and place fixed by Laws of the State of Mississippi

and ordinance of the City of Long Beach for holding said meeting.

There were present and in attendance on said board and at the meeting the

following named persons: Mayor George L. Bass, Aldermen Donald Frazer, Ronald

Robertsort Bernie Parker, Kelly Griffiru Timothy McCaffrey, Jr., Mark E. Lisheru Patricia

Bennett, Deputy City Clerk Kini Gonsouliru and City Attorney James C. Simpsor; Jr.

There being a quorum present sufficient to transact the business of the City, the

following proceedings were had and done.

Through proclamatioru the Mayor encouraged every citizen to participate in the

ra- !F rF rt * !t * rF rF rF )F * * * rF )F rF * ri * * rF rt tt rf

,F !F rT rF rF * * )T )t * !F rF * * )C )F )t *. rF rF * * * tF !t

* * * * * rF !F rF * * rr * * * rT * rF rF * ri rF * )T * rF

*

2020 Census.

Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman McCaffrey and

unanimously carried to approve the Regular and Executive Session minutes of the

Mayor and Board of Aldermen dated May 21-,2019, as submitted.

Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman McCaffrey and

unanimously carried to approve the regular minutes of the Planning & Development

Commission dated May 23,2019, as submitted, with the exception of item #3 under VII.

New Business - Case Review (Cell Tower); submitted by Tillman Infrastructure.

,F

There came on for consideration an appeal filed by Attorney Michael ]. Bradley

on behalf of American Tower Corporatiort as follows:

M.B.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of |une 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

I
MichaelJ. Bentley
Partner
mbentley@bradley.conr
601.592.9935 direc*

Brad

I

Via Electonic MaiI, Facsimik, and Federal Eqress

May 3I" 2019

Stacey Dahl, City Clerk
City of Long Beach
201 JeffDavis Avenue
Long Beach" Mississippi 39560
cityclerk@c ityofl ongbeachms.corn

RE: Notice of Appeal of Planning Commission Action
Tillman Infrastructure - Cell Tower Application (5130 Beatline Road)

Dear Ms. Dahl

GTP Acquisition Partners ll, LLC, a wholly owned subsidiary of American Tower
cor?oration f'American Tower'), appeals the Planning commission's approval of rillrnan
lnfrastructure's application to erect a lSGfoot cell phone lower in the'Pecan Park North and
Wisteria Lane neighborhoods, at 5130 Beatline Road. Tillmanos tower would be conshucted only
200 feet away from American Tower's existing cell tower-less than the length of a city block.

' American Tower rcquests a duly noticed hearing on its appeal, as provided for in Sections
68-73 of the City's Zoning Ordinance.

At the hearing, American Tower will present evidence and arguments in support of its
appeal, including but not Iimited to:

r The Planning Commission acted without having all rrlevant information, including
objections and evidence from American Tower, and without providing notice to
American Tower despite its express rcquest for notice and an opportunity to be heard.

o Tillman's proposed cell tower will not improve or expand existing wireless voice and
data coverage for the citizens of Long Beach and the Mississippi Culf Coast, as
American Tower's existing tower already provides substantially similar coverage for
the community.

Bradlay A€nt Boult Cummings LLP I Ons Jackson Plm | 188 East Capitol Slreot, Suite 1000 | Jsk$n, MS 39201 | 601.S4s.s000 | btradley.com

t

M.B.90
Reg 06.04.19



182

Upon discussion, Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman

McCaffrey and unanimously carried to schedule a public hearing, Tuesday, JuIy 2,2019,

5:00 o'clock p.ttr., Long Beach City Hall Meeting Room, 201Jeff Davis Avenue, to

consider said appeal.

Alderman Griffin made motion seconded by Alderman Frazer and unanimously

carried to approve payment of invoices listed in Docket of Claims number 060419.

Minutes of june 4,2019
Mayor and Board of Aldermen

Notice of Appeal of Planning Commission Aclion
May 31,2019
Page 2

. Tillman's announced nationale for constructing another tower in [.ong Beach, which is

to further Tillman's private business interests by creating redundant infrastructure
without providing any coverage benefits to Long Beach, does not support approval of
an additional tower in the targeted community.

. Tillman's proposed 180-foot cell tower requires a height variance because it will be

located in an area zoned C-2, which is subject to a 45-foot height limitation. Tillman
has not requested or obtained a height variance in accordance with the procedures

established by the City's Zoning Ordinance-including Section 6l and Sections 68-73.

Again, these are just some of American 'Ibwer's anticipated objections to the Planning

Commission's action. Additional reasons, arguments, and evidence will be presented at the

hearing on American T'ower's appeal.

Please let me know the date on which the appeal hearing will be held.

If you have any questions or require additional information regarding American Tower's
appeal, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,

Michael Bentley
Attorney for American'fower Corporation

cc: Mayor Ceorge L. Bass (via email naJgr@siusflp[Cbgashlu.cam)
Ward 5 Alderman Mark l"ishen (via email mlishen@eeh.ms)
Tina Dahl (via email at tina((Dcit)'oflongbeachms.com)
William D. Drinkwater, Esq. (via email at wdruk1yatef@brug|0i.cold

M.8.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of June 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman Lishen and unanimously

carried to pay invoices to The All-Nighters for $800 and Category 6 for $4000 for Jeepin

The Coast entertainment.(

t_

i_

There came on for consideration a request to use the Senior Center and waive all

applicable fees, as follows:

Camival Association of Long Beach
P.O. Box 120

Long Beach, MS 39560

To: City of Long Beach

Re: Use of the Senior Center

Carnival Association of Long Beach would like to request the following dates to utilize
the Senior center on Daughtery Rd. we are also asking for reduced or waived lbes.
Please feel free to contact myself or Jason Green with any questions.

July 7s * Kids Dance

July 27th - Announcement Party

August 17ft - Back to School Dance for kids

September 21sr - Bunco

October 12 - Kids Dance

November 16 - Holiday Tea

December 14 - Bunco

January 11 * Kids Dance

February I - Drawdown

Sincerely,

Jennifer Glenn
Immediate Past President
Carnival Association of Long Beach

Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman Griffin and unanimously

carried to approve the foregoing request.

* * rF rF rF rF * * * r$ rF * * * rF )F * rF * rt rF * * *,*

I
L-
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Minutes of fune 4,20L9

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

The Franchise Agreements - C Spire & Southern Light was tabled until the June

18,2019 meeting.

* * rF * * * * * rT * rt rF * * * rF rt :f ,l * rT tT tF rt *

Alderman Lishen made motion seconded by AldermanFrazer and unanimously

carried to approve the following Amendment #3 to Contract for Public Works Services:

AMENDMENTNO.3
To Contract tr'or

Public Works Senlces
For The

City of Long Beach, MS

In consideratioo ofthe promises set forth in the contract dated December lst" 2009,
between the city of Long Beach, Missi*rippi (hereinafter rcferred to as the owner), and
Utiltty Partners, LLC, hereinafter referred to as the Operator, whose address is t?10
23td Avenue, Gul&ort Ms 39501 regarding the above captioned project, the parties agree
the contract is amended as follows:

Owner and Op€ralor agree to the following:

A. ARTICLE2,SCOPE OF'SERVICES

2,ll Porform other contract utility system operadons services as directed by the
City. Such services must be pre-authorized by the Owner and the cost of
those seryices will be negotiated between the Owner and the Operator prior
to any work being performed.

2.24 Pmvided suJficient staff to perform services on bebalf of the Long Beach
Water Maoagement District.

B. ARTICLE 4, CoST OF WoRK

Item 4.2, Thc Cost of Services to be adjusted according to the following table:

Operator shall be limited to an annual increose for cost ofliving adjushnat of
1.85% per year beginning on December l, 201 8 and in ensuing years ofthis
Agraement as scheduled below. The base fees presented in Article 4 shall be in
accordance with the schedule shown below.

December l, 2020 - Novomber 30.2021

December 1,2019 - November 30. 2020

Decembg! 1, 2018 - November 30, 2019

$ 2,030,026
$ 1.993.1s3

$ 1.956.949
AMEND.#2

fdditiolaily, Operator shall be comperuated for services related to the Long
Beach water Management Dishict. This service shall begin on July ld, 2019 antt
b€ billed according to the following schedule:

M.8.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of June 4,2079
Mayor and Board of Aldermen

All other paragraphs remain as originally written.

tN WIINESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have indicated their approval of this
Amendment by their sigrraturcs belowl

City of Long Beach, MS
(0wnei')

Date:

Date:

er,-s.r.*--l)*L$-
Title: Ciry Cle* ./

sv'k*re
Joe Culfepper, Project fulanager

t ls\rq Date: r'ay ?/, 'ti la

l"ltility Prrtneri, LLC
(Operator)

By
Bass Robert J. Knesal. Vice

Date: //4Y ?),'LQt?

,F *,S :T :I,F,F,F,F,F,F :F * :T,T'T'F'F'$'F'} :T II'f 
'+

,t :F :t rt rF rF rF rF rF rF rF r+ :+ )F :T rF rt rt rt ri rt * r|. li :$

t

Alderman Lishen made motion seconded by Alderman Griffin and unanimously

carried to reschedule the Work Session to discuss Food Trucks, previously scheduled

for ]une IL,20L9, to |une 25,2019.

['L
After considerable discussion, Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by

Alderman McCaffrey and unanimously carried to direct City Attorney Iim Simpson to

draft an ordinance to allow the City to accept a payment in lieu of sidewalk installation

if applicable.

M.B.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of june 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

The Mayor reminded the Board that the Planning & Development Commission

appointees' terms will expire this month and to be prepared to have appointments at

the June 18, 2019 meeting. He also reminded the Board that one of the Library Board

appointee positions will be expiring soon.

)F rF * * tg * rF * * * !+ rt * )F rF * * * * * rF )F rt * *

)F rF )t rF * * !F !T rF )T rF )f * * * rl !F rF tF )F * * !F rF rF

Based on the recommendations of Department Heads and certification by the

Civil Service Commissiorg Alderman Parker made motion seconded by Alderman

Frazer and unanimously carried to approve personnel matters, as follows:

Police Deoartment:

'1,6,2019

1,,2019

Fire Department:

Recreation:

Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman McCaffrey and

unanimously carried to schedule two Work Sessions, Tuesday, luly 9,2019 at 5:00

o'clock p.m., and Tuesday,July 30,2019 at 5:00 o'clock p.m., City Hall Meeting Room,

201,Jeff Davis Avenue, Long Beach Mississippi, to DISCUSS FISCAL YEAR 2019-2020

BUDGET; and to schedule the PUBLIC HEARING ON THE PROPOSED BUDGET

AND PROPOSED TAX LEVIES FOR FISCAL YEAR 2019-2020. Tuesday, August 20,

2019 at 5:00 o'clock p.rrr., City Hall Meeting Room, 201,Jeff Davis Avenue, Long Beactu

Mississippi.

M.8.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of |une 4,2019
Mayor and Board of Aldermen

Based on the following recommendation from City Engineer David Balf

Alderman Lishen made motion seconded by Alderman Griffin and unanimously

carried to reject the single bid received for Long Beach Paving - Term Bid, and rebid per

schedule below:

161 Lameuse St,, Suite 203
Biloxi, MS 39530

228-96't -7 137

TR5'TF!TET
6. FISECICIFiTE5

June 4, 2019
June 7, 2019
June '14, 2019
July 9, 2019

630 Delmas Ave,, Suite B
Pascagoula, MS 39567

228-967-7137
O-
CEN=;ULTING TNEINTERS

May 31, 2019

City of Long Beach
P.0. Box 929
Long Beach, MS 39560

RE: Long Beach Paving - Term Bid

Ladies and Gentlemen:

The City had scheduled to received and open bids for the referenced term bid project on
Tuesday, May 28. We followed the typical advertisement process, including digital planroom
availability at 2 locations, along with emailed notifications of the advertisement for work to several
of the "local" asphalt companies in our area. However, we only received one bid for the project,
submitted by T.L. wallace construction, lnc., of columbia, MS. Further, the bid proposal didn't
include prices for certain contract items, meaning the Contractor was unable or unwilling to
perform those types of work. This seems to be the case because the proposed work included
both types of asphalt work in one contract: typical asphalt repairs (base repairs, overlay, etc.)
which may be called conventional asphalt work, along with the "maintenance" or rehabilitation
asphalt work (chip seal, cape seal, microsurfacing, etc.). Apparenily, no single contractor
performs both types of work. We have attached a Certified Tabulation of the Bids.

This is an unfortunale situation, but our recommendation is to reject the single bid from
T.L. Wallace, and to proceed to readvertise the project for competitive bidding a second time.
However, this time we proposed to advertise fortwo separate projects (Asphalt Repairs & Asphalt
Maintenance). There will be a bit of additional work to prepare Bid Documents for the two different
projects, but we believe we will obtain more bids for the work if they are separated as described.

lf this is acceptable to the City, we recommend the following advertising schedule:

Authorize Advertisement:
First Advertisement:
Second Advertisement:
Receive Bkls:

lf approved, we hope to have a Bid Tabulation and Recommendation of Award at the July 16,
2019 meeting.

Ball, P.E.

DB:1044

Attachment

O:U044 LB Annual Term Bid - Asphalt Repairs\20190530 Reject & ReAdvert Schedule.docx

M.8.90
Reg 05.04.19
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Minutes of June 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

TABUTATION OF AIDS

C]rY OF TON6 BEACH

ANNUAT rERM SrDS - ASPfiAtt REpATR/R€STOnATTON

Bid 2019

Cert. No.16546

s/3Ll2oL9

PaBe 1 of I

)t * * * * * * * * * * * * :t * * * * * * * rF * rt x

SCHEDUI.E 1 woRK):

02.1-A

03.1-A

rlNG FOG SEAr {1-300 SY}

PERFORMING FOG SEAL (1-300 sY)

{t4_11.A P SEAL (1-300 5Y)

05.1-A scRUB SEAr {1.3m 5Y,)

(1-3m sY)

10-78-A BITUMINOUS PAVEMENI SURFACE COURS€

10-?B-D BTTUMINOUS PAv€MENT LIVELING COURSE (ST-9.5 mm)(1't0 ton5)

10-7S-G

10-7BJ

EITUMINOUS FAVEMENT BASE COURSE {ST-25 mmXl-20 tons}

MATERIAI (LVM) {1.10 CY)

11.01-A

11.11-A

SURFACING sY)

rGH POLYMER MTCRO SURFACTNG (1-300 SYI

SCHEDUIE 2 (MEDTUM WORK):

oi.r.e
03.1-B

roe sea_r-,-{gor,:ooo svj
IGH PERFORMING FOG SEAL

05.1-B

70-7A-2

10-78'B

5CRU8 SEAr {301-3000 SY)

MrrLrNG 
-of 

AS?HALr,lAL-q PF,l]ltfl.H9l:10qq sy)

BITUMINOUS SURFACE COURSE {ST-12.5

10,7S-E mm)(21-40O

1078-H

10.78"(

rons)

GROUP SHOULDER MATERIAI IrvM cY)

11.11-B POLYMER MICRO SURFACIN

FOG STAL

03.1.8 IGH 5Y)

04.11-C SEAL (3000+ SY)

05.1-C SCRUB SEAL (3000+ SY)

10.7A-3 MlLtlNG oF ASpHALT lAll DfrrHS) (3000+ Sv)

COURSE (ST-12.5 mmJ(40Or tons)

10-78-F

lG7B-t
BITUMINOUS PAVEMENI LEVELING COURSE {ST-9.5 mmx400+

BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT BASE COURSE (SL25 mmX40O+ tons)

10.78-L {r.vM) (100+ cY}

11.01-C SURFACING

ITEM

NO_

19tllBf f -r-o_B-s"g.!.D_.?lltg;
Cenifi cate of Respon5ibiliry-No-:

Bid gond:

ITTM

SY

TON

CY

SY

T.ON

ION

SY

5Y

SY

s!
SY

SY

5Y

TON

TON

CY

TON

5Y

SY

SY

SY

SY

SY

SY

TON

TON

CY

TON

SY

5Y

SY

5Y

SY

UNIT OF

MEASURE

s5.SO

NO BID

NO 8tD._."_.*

s6.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

.... .....11,,-8.-o-. ...-....

--.,,..-l-?,0-s.." $,1,79

33.90

il,99
NO BID

NO BIO

NO BrD- 
-._- _

NO SID

56.s0
s7.00

NO 8ID

S2.2s

s4.00

NO BID

s2.00

UNIT

PRICE

0377S.MC

YES

ENGINEER

r0316

M.8.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of |une 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

Alderman Lishen made motion seconded by Alderman Griffin and unanimously

carried to approve the following advertisement schedule for Clower Avenue Water

Main Improvements:t
161 Lameuse St.. Suite 203

Biloxi, MS 39530
228-9tt7:7137

EFISTFltIE'T
s FqSSEEtR-rE=i

June 4, 2019
June 7, 201 9
June 14,2019
July 9, 2019

630 DelmasAve.. Sulte B
Pascagoula, MS 39567

228-f$7-7't37
O-
ECINSIJLTINEI SNGiINEERE

May 31, 2019

City of Long Beacfr
P.O. Box 929
Long Beach, MS 39560

RE: Clower Avenue Water lllain lmprovements

Ladies and Gentlemen:

We have nearly completed the Bid Docurnents forthe referenced projed, and are ready to request
competitive bids for the construction of the projed. Therefore, if it pbases the Board, we
recommend the following advertising schedub:

Authorize Advertisement:
First Advertisement:
Second Advertisement:
Receive Bids:t lf approved, we hope to have a Bid Tahrlathn and Recommendation of Award at the July 16,

2019 meeting.

Ball, P.E.

DB:1037

O:\1037VO190531 Clower Advert Schedule,docx Page I of 1

t

M.B.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of |une 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

Alderman Robertson made motion seconded by Alderman Frazer and

unanimously carried to approve the following Amendment2019-2.1, to the contract with

Overstreet & Associates for City Engineering Services:

161 Lameuse St., Suile 203
Biloxi. MS 39530

22A-987-7 137

EF?g'TFREET
s. FAggClElFt-rt=

630 DelmasAve., Suite B
Pascagoula, MS 39567

228-967-7.137
O-
CTfNEULTING ENCIINEEF{S

May 31, 201 9

City of Long Beach
P.O. Box 929
Long Beach, MS 39560

RE: Amendment 2019-2.1
MDA/Gulf Coast Restoration Council
City Engineering Services

Ladies and Gentlemen:

We have had several meetings with the Board of Aldermen and with the Mayor as projects
have been selected and clarified for the referenced application process. We expect continuing
meetings and coordination with the City as the selected projects are "fleshed out' for the
application process. Further, it seems profitable that the City would also apply for some desired
projects through the GOMESA funding/application process, in addition to the BP/RESTORE
projects previously discussed. The projects that have been selected so far for the application
process are:

. Jeff Davis Galeway

. Quarles House lmprovements

. Beatline Road Widening/Corridor

. Drainagelmprovements

. Sewer lmprovements at Railroad/Klondyke

Additionally, Overstreet & Associates offers to the City through this amendment the
services of Mr. Howard Page, a local grant-writer with particular knowledge and experience in
these environmental funding opportunities. Not only does Mr. Page bring considerable ability to
the process but we believe we will realize increased efficiency and economy by his addition to the
project. The rate for such services is included in the attached proposed Amendment.

As part of this Amendment, Overstreet is asking for an increase in the maximum allowable
fee for the application process, in consideration of the forthcoming meetings and work necessary
to complete these applications.

lf this is agreeable, we request your approval of this amendment.

P,E.

DB:539

Attachment

Oi\053g\Eng Agree\20190531 Amend 2019-2.1 to City,docx PaOe 1 of 1

M.8.90
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Minutes of June 4,2019
Mayor and Board of Aldermen

AMENDMENT 1TO AMENDMEiTT 2OL9.2TO MASTER AGREEMETiIT BETWEEN
CIW OF LONG BEACH AND OVERSTREET & ASSOCIATES, PLIC.

(AMENDMENT 2019-2.11

It is agreed to modifo the standard rates for Professional Services for City Engineering services in accordance
with the provisions contained in the Master Agreement dated August Z, 2019:

A. SCOPE

1. Certain projects will also be applied for using the GOMESA funding/application process, as directed
by the City.

B. BA:'IS OF COMPEilSATION

1. Hourly fees as allowed in the Master Agreement will be modified in accordance with the hourly
rates recited on the attached EXH|B|T "A".

2. Thetotalofallfeesforserviceswillnotexceed$lQ000withoutfurtherauthorizationbytheCity.

OWNER: ENGINEER:

crw QF LoN6 BSACH, MtSStSStPPt OVERSTREET & ASSOCIATES, PLLC.

George Overstreet, P.E.

Pr€sident
MS PE S18601

Date 5*5-t DateSigned:,54!t20!9-_

Page 1 of 2

t

t

M.8.90
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, Minutes of lune 4,20L9

Mayor and Board of Aldemen

EXHIBIT'A''

OVERSTREET & ASSOCIATES

STANDARD HOURLY RATES SCHEOUIE

EFFECTME SEPTEMBER 1, 2018

Position BillilB Rate

t1"n mSurvey Crew ll

Survey Crew I .5110.00

Grant Writer....... ...................".".. 5100.00

Page 2 of 2

It came on for discussion the derelict property at247 Reinike Road. City

Attorney ]im Simpson apprised the Board that he would have the lawsuits ready to file

on all the properties that had been previously condemned in two weeks. The Mayor

recognized Mrs. Virginia Norton of 108 W. Azalea Drive to speak regarding the

condemned property at247 Reinike Road, whereupon there was no further action

required or taken.

M.8.90
Reg 06.04.19
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Minutes of June 4,2019

Mayor and Board of Aldermen

There came upon for consideration, a lawsuit fited by Robert M. Daley

requesting vacation of the plat of Park Place Condominium. After discussiorL and upon

the recommendation of City Attorney Jim Simpson, Alderman Parker made motiorL

seconded by Alderman Frazer and unanimously carried to authorizeMr.Simpson to

answer the request to vacate plat of the Park Place Condominium with no objections.

The City Attorney apprised the Mayor and Board of the status of the Tidelands

Lease, whereupon no action was action required or taken.

Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman Robertson and

unanimously carried to declare an Executive Session for the transaction of public

business, to wit: To discuss with and seek legal advice and counsel of the City Attorney

regarding pending litigation.

The question having received the affirmative voice vote of all of the Aldermen

present and voting, the Mayor declared the motion carried, whereupon the Board

entered into Executive Session

Alderman Frazer made motion seconded by Alderman Robertson and

unanimously carried to retum to Open Sessioru whereupon the Board of Aldermen

voted to direct the City Attorney to proceed to resolve the pending litigation as

discussed in Executive Session.

* * * * rF * rF rF rF rt rF * * * * * * * rt )F * rF * *
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There being no further business to come before the Mayor and Board of Aldermen

at this time, Alderman Griffin made motion seconded by Alderman Lishen and

unanimously carried to adjourn until the next regular meeting in due course.

* * * :+ rt * * * * * * * rF rF rt rt * rF * :F :F :F rT :t *

APPROVED:

Alderman Donald Frazer, At-Large

Alderman Ronald Robertsoru Ward 1

Alderman Bernie Parker, Ward 2

Alderman Kelly Griffiru Ward 3

Alderman Timothy McCaffrey, lr.,Ward 4

Alderman Mark E. Lisheru Ward 5

Alderman Patricia Bennett, Ward 6

Date
ATTEST:

Kini GonsouluL Deputy City Clerk
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